EXHIBIT B

Bid Tabulation
Furniture
RADG Holdings, LLC Thrifty Office Furniture MityLite, Inc. Shev Chair Mfg. Co
Item Qty Unit Each | Total Price | Unit Each | Total Price |Unit Each | Total Price | Unit Each | Total Price
Board Chairs 16 $406.00 $6,496.00 $757.66 $12,122.56 | No Bid No Bid
Conf. Boardroom Tables 2 $1,606.20 $3,212.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stack Chairs 1800 $130.80 | $235,440.00 $94.90 $170,820.00 | No Bid $109.95 $197,910.00
Fold/Roll Risers/Ramp 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rectangle Folding Tables 50 $600.00 $30,000.00 No Bid $262.00 | $13,100.00 No Bid
Top Madera Tables 50 $730.00 $36,500.00 No Bid $219.00 | $10,950.00 No Bid
Circular Madera Tables 100 *$347.75 | $34,775.00 No Bid $385.00 | $38,500.00 No Bid
Carts 42" Narrow 6 No Bid No Bid $527.00 | $3,162.00 No Bid
Carts 42" Wide 6 No Bid No Bid $569.00 | $3,414.00 No Bid
Total Bid $346,423.40 $182,942.56 $69,126.00 $197,910.00

* Does not meet specs. to

match existing tables




	chairs

